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Introduction: Biochemistry is a discipline offered in graduation courses. In 
general, the students define Biochemistry as “complex and extensive”, since, in 
most cases, a broad content is ministered in a short period of time. The 
consequences of this context may be reflected in the lack of interest by the 
students. Thus, the use of alternative methodologies presents potential to 
improve this situation. Objectives: Develop and implement educational games 
about protein content to review and arouse students' interest in the discipline.  
Materials and Methods: The educational games were made from available 
materials and low cost. The games were applied in extracurricular schedules in 
Biology, Biotechnology, Biomedicine and Agronomy courses of the Federal 
University of Uberlândia in the second half of 2015. All of this games count with 
the presence of a mediator to solve questions and correct mistakes that can 
appear. Results and discussions: Three educational games were created: 
"Amino Game 2.0", "Memo Protein" and "Race of Enzymes" which addressing 
the content of amino acid ionization, structure and function of proteins and 
enzymes, respectively. "AminoGame 2.0" is based on the correct assembly of 
structures of amino acids, dipeptides or tripeptides in according to conditions 
described on card game randomly selected by the player. "Memoprotein" is a 
memory game in which the player must correctly answer a question about 
protein to have the right to turn the cards of the game. Finally, "Race of 
Enzymes" is a board game in which the player must correctly answer questions 
about enzymes to have the right to advancing squares on the board. The 
application of three games showed good acceptance among students. 
Conclusions: “Amino Game 2.0", "Memo Protein" and "Race of Enzymes" 
were considered to be effective tools in the teaching of Biochemistry. 
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